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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for

FOR: Chlorination Equipment Parts

TIME & (January 1, 2014 through December 31, 2014)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., December 20, 2013
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

 10 ea. UNIT *

Capital Controls Ecometrics, Series 480 Gas Chlorinator.  100 ppd Cylinder PRICE 3,461.00

1. Mount, Automatic Switchover, Model 481C5 TOTAL 34,610.00 No Bid

5 ea. UNIT

Capital Controls Advance Series 200 Gas Chlorinator 500 ppd, PRICE 7,156.00

2. Ton Container Mount, Righ-hand oriented, automatic switchover Model 203 TOTAL 35,780.00 No Bid

2 ea. UNIT

Capital Controls Advance Series 480, 3" Remote Meter Panel, 100 ppd PRICE 383.00

3. Part #RM02C7 TOTAL 766.00 No Bid

2 ea. UNIT

Capital Controls Advance Series 200, 3" Remote Meter Panel, 250 ppd PRICE 564.00

4 Part #RM25C3 TOTAL 1,128.00 No Bid

2 ea. UNIT

Capital Controls Advance Series 200, 6" Remot Meter Panel, 500 ppd PRICE 589.00

5. Part #RM008C TOTAL 1,178.00 No Bid

1 ea. UNIT

Capital Controls Ecometrics, Series 480, Chlorine Vacuum Regulator, 100 ppd PRICE  

6. With Rate Valve TOTAL 1,263.00 No Bid

25 ea. UNIT

Capital Controls Ecometrics, Series 480, Chlorine Vacuum Regulator, 100 ppd PRICE 957.00

7. Plugged TOTAL 23,925.00 No Bid

1 ea. UNIT

Capital Controls Advance Series 200, Chlorine Vacuum Regulator, Ton PRICE

8 Mounted, 500 ppd with Rate Valve TOTAL 2,653.00 No Bid

2 ea. UNIT

Capital Controls Advanced Series 200, Chlorine Vacuum Regulator, PRICE 2,159.00

9 Ton Mounted, 500 ppd Plugged TOTAL 4,318.00 No Bid

15 ea. UNIT

Capital Controls Automatic Switchover Module, Chlorine, 100 ppd Max PRICE 542.00

10. Part #AS-100C TOTAL 8,130.00 No Bid

3 ea. UNIT

Capital Controls Automatic Switchover Module, Chlorine, 250 ppd Max PRICE 541.00

11. Part #AS-200C TOTAL 1,623.00 No Bid

2 ea. UNIT

Capital Controls Automatic Switchover Module, Chlorine, 500 ppd Max, PRICE 556.00

12. Part #AS-500C TOTAL 1,112.00 No Bid

15 ea. UNIT

Capital Controls O-Ring Ejector, 100 ppd, 20-140 psi max back pressure. Part # PRICE 567.00

13. EJ-100C (provide back pressure and throat/nozzle size at time of order) TOTAL 8,505.00 No Bid
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5 ea. UNIT

Capital Controls O-Ring Ejector, 250 ppd, 20-140 psi max back pressure. Part # PRICE 792.00  

14. EJ-200C1 (provide back pressure and throat/nozzle size at time of order) TOTAL 3,960.00 No Bid

5 ea. UNIT

Capital Controls O-Ring Ejector, 500 ppd. 20-140 psi max back pressure. Part # PRICE 792.00

15. EJ-500C ( provide back pressure and throat/nozzle size at time of order) TOTAL 3,960.00 No Bid

 UNIT

15 ea. PRICE 399.00  

16. 0-300 PSI Gauge, 2 inch dial, with protective diaphragm Part #A-201-1 TOTAL 5,985.00 No Bid

UNIT *

6 ea. PRICE NO BID 6,000.00

17. Robo-Control Model 2000 TOTAL  36,000.00  

 UNIT *

1 ea. PRICE  

18. Series WP840 Automatic Gas Control Valve, 250 ppd max, Part #14409-5 TOTAL 2,426.00 No Bid

 UNIT

1 ea. PRICE  

19. Series WP840 Automatic Gas Control Valve, 500 ppd max, Part #14409-4 TOTAL 2,310.00 No Bid

UNIT

2 ea. PRICE 3,003.00

20. Controller Model 1450, Series WP840 Controller, Parts List #315.7001 TOTAL 6,006.00 No Bid

UNIT

2 ea. PRICE 5,257.00

21. Capital Controls Model NXT 3000 Vacuum Regulator, 500 ppd kit. TOTAL 10,514.00 No Bid

 UNIT

15 ea. PRICE 359.00

22. Filter, Specialty for CL2, Part #R1398 TOTAL 5,385.00 No Bid

  UNIT

2 ea. PRICE 4,468.00

23. Capital Controls Vacuum Regulator, Chlorine, 8000 PPD, Part #VR8000C1 TOTAL 8,936.00 No Bid

 UNIT

2 ea. PRICE 5,232.00

24. Capital Controls Vacuum Regulator, Sulfur Dioxide, 8000 PPD, Part #VR8000S1 TOTAL 10,464.00 No Bid
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 UNIT  

1 ea. PRICE  

25. Capital Controls Vacuum Regulator, Chlorine, 40000 PPD, Part #VR4000C6N2 TOTAL 4,340.00 No Bid

UNIT

PRICE

26. Allowance for miscellaneous parts not listed Budget: $75,000 TOTAL   

 PRICE  

LIST  

Discount Off Price List (%) % 0%  

    

    

Effective Date of Price List DATE 1/1/14  

   

  

Estimated Miscellaneous Parts Purchase PRICE 75,000.00

500.00

FREIGHT

GRAND TOTAL TOTAL 264,277.00 36,500.00

EXTENSION 1 264,277.00 36,500.00

EXTENSION 2 264,277.00 36,500.00

EXTENSION 3 264,277.00 36,500.00

Net Net

Terms 30 days 30 days

 

Delivery Days

*LOW BIDDER
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BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

CL2 Equipment Co. Demandstar
Enviro-Pump of SA SAWS Website

 Global Treat, Inc.

JCS Industries, Inc.

Macaulay Controls Co.  

Robo-Control
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